
1- Orson Welles Broadcast Radio Play – War of the World

Extrait 1 : 9’20

FADE IN PIANO PLAYING)ANNOUNCER TWO: Ladies and gentlemen, here is the latest 
bulletin from the Intercontinental Radio News. Toronto, Canada: Professor Morse of McGill
University reports observing a total of three explosions on the planet Mars, between the 
hours of 7:45 P. M. and 9:20 P. M., eastern standard time. This confirms earlier reports 
received from American observatories. Now, nearer home, comes a special announcement
from Trenton, New Jersey. It is reported that at 8:50 P. M. a huge, flaming object, believed 
to be a meteorite, fell on a farm in the neighborhood of Grovers Mill, New Jersey, twenty-
two miles from Trenton. The flash in the sky was visible within a radius of several hundred 
miles and the noise of the impact was heard as far north as Elizabeth. We have 
dispatched a special mobile unit to the scene, and will have our commentator, Carl Phillips,
give you a word description as soon as he can reach there from Princeton. In the 
meantime, we take you to the Hotel Martinet in Brooklyn, where Bobby Millette and his 
orchestra are offering a program of dance music.(SWING BAND FOR TWENTY 
SECONDS . . . THEN CUT)

Extrait 2 : 31’09

COMMANDER: Army bombing plane, V-8-43, off Bayonne, New Jersey, Lieutenant Voght, 
commanding eight bombers. Reporting to Commander Fairfax, Langham Field . . . This is 
Voght, reporting to Commander Fairfax, Langham Field . . . Enemy tripod machines now in
sight. Reinforced by three machines from the Morristown cylinder . . . Six altogether. One 
machine already crippled. Believed hit by shell from army gun in Watchung Mountains. 
Guns now appear silent. A heavy black fog hanging close to the earth . . . of extreme 
density, nature unknown. No sign of heat ray. Enemy now turns east, crossing Passaic 
River into the Jersey marshes. Another straddles the Pulaski Skyway. Evident objective is 
New York City. They're pushing down a high tension power station. The machines are 
close together now, and we're ready to attack. Planes circling, ready to strike. A thousand 
yards and we'll be over the first -- eight hundred yards . . . six hundred . . . four 
hundred . . . two hundred . . . There they go! The giant arm raised . . . (SOUND OF HEAT 
RAY) Green flash! They're spraying us with flame! Two thousand feet. Engines are giving 
out. No chance to release bombs. Only one thing left . . . drop on them, plane and all. 
We're diving on the first one. Now the engine's gone! Eight . . . (PLANE GOES DOWN)


